                                                                   STATE BUILDING CODE


The final Legislative Rule, Title 87, Series 4, updating the state Building Code has, been filedwithe Secretary of State’s Office, effective July 1, 2010. 

                Each municipality and county will have to formally adopt the new editions by ordinance and send  a copy to Deputy State Fire Marshal Tony Carrico, WFSFM, 1207, Quarrier St., 2nd Floor,  Charleston, WV, 25301 or email, anthony.w.carrico@wv.gov. Each ordinance must include any of the appendices your city or county wishes to enforce. Adopting the specific code(s) does not automatically adopt the appendices. Most of the codes have local inserts that must be included in the adopting ordinance.

                 The new code(s) are:  
                


2009 International Building Code
                                                          2009 International Residential Code
                                                          2009 International Existing Building Code

                                                          2009 International Plumbing Code
                                                          2009 International Mechanical Code   
                                                          2009 International Fuel Gas Code
                                                          2003 International Energy Conservation Code
                                                          2003 ICC/ANSI  A117.1 Accessible & Usable Buildings
                                                          2009 International Property Maintenance Code
                                                          2008 NFPA 70, National Electric Code 

            There are several amendments which are a part of the code(s) and are included in the adoption:

IBC -  Section 101.4.5   Fire Prevention:  DELETE ENTIRE SECTION
          Section 113.3  Qualifications: DELETE & REPLACE WITH: The Board of Appeals shall consist of five
                                     members, with up to three alternates, who are qualified to pass on matters
                                     pertaining to building construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction,
                                     They may include, but are not limited to, a WV Registered Professional 
                                     Architect, or a WV Licensed General Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping,
                                     Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire Protection Contractor, with at least 10 years
                                     experience, five of which shall be in responsible charge or work.

IRC – Section R303.5.1 Light Activation: DELETE & REPLACE WITH: The control for activation of the
                                         required interior stairway lighting shall be accessible at the top and bottom
                                         of each stairway without traversing any steps. The illumination of exterior
                                         stairways shall be controlled from inside the dwelling unit. EXCEPTIONS:
                                         1. Lights that are continuously illuminated or automatically controlled.
                                         2. Interior stairways consisting of less than three steps.
           Section R311.3.1 Floor Elevations at Required Egress Doors: DELETE & REPLACE WITH:
                                          Where a stairway of two or fewer risers is located on the exterior side of a 
                                         door, other than the required exit door, a landing is not required for the
                                          exterior side of the door.

           Section R311.7.4.1 Riser Height: DELETE & REPLACE WITH: The maximum riser height shall be
                                              eight and one-quarter (8 ¼) inches.

           Section R311.7.4.2 Tread Depth: DELETE & REPLACE WITH: The minimum tread depth shall be
                                              nine (9) inches. 

           Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems: DELETE ENTIRE SECTION, NO REPLACEMENT

           Section R403.1.7.1 Building clearances from Ascending Slopes: DELETE, NO REPLACEMENT

           Section R403.1.7.2 Footing setbacks from Descending Slopes:  DELETE, NO REPLACEMENT

           Chapter 11, Section N1101-1104 Energy Efficiency:  DELETE, NO REPLACEMENT

IEBC – Section 101.4.2 Buildings Previously Occupied:  DELETE “International Fire Code”. REPLACE WITH:
                                          “ 2009 NFPA 101- Life Safety Code” 


EXCEPTIONS:  The following structures are not subject to inspection by local jurisdictions:  Group U utility structures comprising an area of not more than 150 square feet which have no plumbing or electrical connections and are used only for residential storage purposes.  (Examples include sheds that are for the residential storage of lawnmowers, tools, bicycles or furniture.) Not included are those utility structures and storage sheds which have plumbing or electrical connections, area on non-residential sue or for the storage of explosives or other hazardous of explosive materials.

CONFLICTS:

             

                
