                                                   2009 STATE BUILDING CODE ADOPTION


The Joint Legislative Rulemaking Committee met Tuesday, December 8, 2009 at 1:00 pm to review the rule unanimously approved by the State Fire Commission June 19, 2009.

The Committee unanimously approved the proposed rule and forwarded it with a recommendation for approval to the House of Delegates and State Senate, for final action during the 2010 regular legislative session.  The effective date will be probably between April 1 and July 1, 2010.

               The Committee adopted two major amendments, DELETING from the legislative rule and the state building code: (1) International Residential Code (IRC), Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems, both townhouse and one and two family dwellings; and, (2) the ENTIRE International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) in entirety.


The proposed Rule included previous exceptions, which remain, including:

IBC/2009 –  Section 101.4.5 Fire Prevention is deleted.

                    Section113 Boards of Appeal is deleted and replaced with: Section 113 Boards of Appeal 
                    Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of five members, with up to three
                    alternates, who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining
                    to building construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction. They may include, but
                    are not limited to, a WV Registered Professional Architect of Engineer, or a WV Licensed 
                    General Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping, Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire Protection 
                    Contractor, with at least 10 years experience, five of which shall be in responsible charge of
                    work.

IFGC/2009 – Section 404.10 Minimum burial depth is deleted and replaced with: Underground piping 
                       shall be a minimum depth of 12 inches (305 mm) below grade. If the minimum depth 
                       cannot be maintained , the piping system shall be installed in conduit or shielded in an
                       approved manner.

IPMC/2009 -  May be rejected by option of the local jurisdiction ,or, may be adopted without adopting 
                         the other national codes and standards.

IRC/2009 -  Section G2415.10 Minimum burial depth is deleted and replaced with: Minimum burial 
                     depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches (305 
                     mm) below grade. If the minimum depth cannot be maintained, the piping system shall be
                     installed in conduit or shielded in an approved manner.




                    Section R303.6.1 Light Activation is deleted and replaced with:  Light Activation. The control 
                    for activation of the of the required interior stairway lighting shall be accessible at the top 
                    and bottom of each stairway without traversing any steps. The illumination of exterior 
                    stairways shall be controlled from inside the dwelling unit. EXCEPTIONS: 1. Lights that are
                   continuously illuminated or automatically controlled. 2. Interior stairways consisting of less
                   than three steps.

                   Section R311.3.  Floors and landings at exterior doors is deleted and replaced with: Landings 
                   at doors. Where a stairway of two or more risers is located on the exterior side of a door, 
                   other than the required exit door, a landing is not required for the exterior side of the door.

                   Section 311.7.4.1  Riser Height is deleted and replaced with: Riser heights. The maximum 
                   riser height shall be eight and one-quarter (8 1/4) inches.            

                   Section 311.7.4.2  Tread depth is deleted and replaced with:  Tread depth . The minim tread 
                   depth shall be nine (9) inches.

                   Chapter 11  Energy Efficiency is deleted and NOT replaced

IEBC/2009  Section 103.4l.2  Buildings previously occupied – delete International Fire Code and replace 
                   with NFPA 101 Life Safety Code/2009.

The  State Building Code will include:




2009 International Building Code (IBC




2009 International Residential Code (IRC

2009 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

2009 International Plumbing Code (IPC)

2009 International Mechanical Code (IMC)

2009 International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC)

2009 International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC)

2003 ICC/ANSI A 117.1  Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities

2008 NFPA 70 – National Electric Code       




2009 NFPA 101 – Life Safety Code







                   
